
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-0237

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Alternator, Starter, Winch Motors

FOR: and Hydraulic Pumps Motors Parts and Service

TIME & (October 1, 2017 through September 30, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 17, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Estimated $30,000.00

ALTERNATOR - PARTS AND EXCHANGE 

I. UNITS, ALL TYPES

1. Percent of discount offered 0% 60% Cost +5%

 

  CD Starter  

2. Product indentification (Mfg.) Big Moe Delco/Bosch Ford Motor Co.

 

 

3. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Government Distributor Dealer

 

 

4. Price schedule number 0110 10-19 F08162017

 
  

5. Date of price schedule Jan. 1, 2017 8/1/17 8/15/17

  

Price schedule column on which discount is 

6. (based distributor, net, wholesale) Price each unit Blue Net Wholesale

ALTERNATORS

 

 

Delco Alternator, Part #321-1107 (equal or better) PRICE 17.00 119.99 N/A

Mfg. and Part # MFG/PART $ 8206 Delco 10463651  

Delco Alternator, Part #321-649 (equal or better) PRICE 17.00 119.99 N/A

Mfr. and Part # MFG/PART $ 7186 Delco 10480058  

Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GL497RM (equal or better) PRICE 18.00 109.99 151.31

Mfr. and Part # MFG/PART $ 7790 Bosch AL7546N Ford GL497RM

Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GL648 (equal or better) PRICE 39.00 139.99 173.18

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 8306 Bosch AL7605X Ford GL648

B
ig

 M
o

e 
A

u
to

m
o

ti
v

e 

R
eb

u
il

d
er

s,
 I

n
c.

5
0

9
6

 B
la

n
co

 #
2

S
an

 A
n

to
n

io
, 

T
X

 7
8

2
1

6

C
D

 S
ta

rt
er

 S
er

v
ic

es
, 

L
L

C

1
0

8
 C

o
zz

i 
C

ir
, 

S
te

. 
B

V
ic

to
ri

a,
 T

X
 7

7
9

0
1

N
o

rt
h

 P
ar

k
 L

in
co

ln

9
2

0
7

 S
an

 P
ed

ro
 A

v
e.

S
an

 A
n

to
n

io
, 

T
X

 7
8

2
1

6

O
'R

ei
ll

y
 A

u
to

 P
ar

ts

2
3

3
 S

. 
P

at
te

rs
o

n

S
p

ri
n

g
fi

el
d

, 
M

O
 6

5
8

0
1

1



F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-0237

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Alternator, Starter, Winch Motors

FOR: and Hydraulic Pumps Motors Parts and Service

TIME & (October 1, 2017 through September 30, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 17, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY B
ig
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Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GL919 (equal or better) PRICE 89.00 189.99 257.02

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 11291 Bosch AL7668X Ford GL919

Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GL643 (equal or better) PRICE 39.00 149.99 289.36

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 8478 Bosch AL7603X Ford GL649

Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GL910 (equal or better) PRICE 28.00 159.99 214.98

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 8448 Ford GL910 Ford GL910

Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GLV8457RM (equal or better) PRICE 39.00 159.99 150.01

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 8265 Bosch AL7597N Ford GLV8457RM

Motorcraft Alternator, Part #GL985RM (equal or better PRICE 39.00 149.99 213.68

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 8307 Bosch AL7603X Ford GL985RM

NAPA Part #2133172k (equal or better) PRICE 39.00  N/A

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART 8306 NO BID  

Toyota Part #27060-75490 (equal or better) PRICE 89.00  N/A

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART 11596 NO BID  

STARTER - PARTS AND EXCHANGE UNITS,

II. ALL TYPES

1. Percent of discount offered 0% 60% Cost +5%

 

  Denso, CD Starter  

2. Product indentification (Mfg.) Big Moe Delco Ford Motor Co.

 

 

3. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Government Distributor Dealer

 

 

4. Price schedule number 0110 2-9 F0816207
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-0237

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Alternator, Starter, Winch Motors

FOR: and Hydraulic Pumps Motors Parts and Service

TIME & (October 1, 2017 through September 30, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 17, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY B
ig
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5. Date of price schedule January 1, 2017 8/1/17 8/2015

  

Price schedule column on which discount is 

6. (based distributor, net, wholesale) Price each unit Blue Net Wholesale

STARTERS 

 

Delco Starter 323-367 PRICE 17.00 169.99 NO BID

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 3733 Denso 281-8000  

Delco Starter 323-1662 PRICE 17.00 129.99 NO BID

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 6970 8000215

Delco Starter 323-900 PRICE 29.00 279.99

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 6400 Delco 10461169

Motorcraft Part #SA948 PRICE 28.00 119.99 140.51

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART $ 6657 IF20-18-1690 Ford SA948

Wilson Part #91014560N PRICE 29.00 325.00 NO BID

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART 6752 Delco 10461298

 

New Holland Part #86992395 PRICE 118.00 179.99 NO BID

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART 19614 428000-1690

NAPA Part #2449292 PRICE 24.00 219.99 NO BID

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART 6646 244-9292  

Toyota Part #28100-75091 PRICE 89.00 159.99 NO BID

Mfr. And Part # MFG/PART 10981 28000-3740
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-0237

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Alternator, Starter, Winch Motors

FOR: and Hydraulic Pumps Motors Parts and Service

TIME & (October 1, 2017 through September 30, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 17, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY B
ig
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WINCH MOTORS - PARTS AND EXCHANGE

III. UNITS, ALL TYPES

1. Percent of discount offered 0% 60%

 

 

2. Product indentification (Mfg.) Big Moe CD Starter

 

 

3. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Jan. 1, 2017 Distributor

 

 

4. Price schedule number 0110 1

 

 

5. Date of price schedule January 1, 2017 8/1/17

  

Price schedule column on which discount is 

6. (based distributor, net, wholesale) Price each unit Blue 

TOTAL TOTAL 804.00

*

TOTAL ITEMS I & II TOTAL 30,804.00

EXTENSION 1 30,804.00

EXTENSION 2 30,804.00

EXTENSION 3 30,804.00
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F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-0237

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Alternator, Starter, Winch Motors

FOR: and Hydraulic Pumps Motors Parts and Service

TIME & (October 1, 2017 through September 30, 2018)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., August 17, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY B
ig
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2% 1% Net

Terms 10 days 25 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days 1 day 0-2 days 2 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BIDS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Automotive Truck Parts Demandstar

Big Moe Automotive Rebuilders SAWS Website

CD Starter Service, LLC

Genuine Parts

North Park Lincoln

Northwest Starter and Alternator

O'Reilly Auto Parts

Sequin Equipment Service

Texas Industrial Electric

TX Alternator Starter

Win Brisben
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